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However, checking out the book Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael
Brettin in this site will lead you not to bring the printed publication almost everywhere you go. Merely store
guide in MMC or computer system disk as well as they are offered to read at any time. The prosperous
heating and cooling unit by reading this soft documents of the Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The
Aftermath By Michael Brettin can be introduced something new behavior. So now, this is time to show if
reading can enhance your life or otherwise. Make Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By
Michael Brettin it undoubtedly work and get all benefits.

Review
"We see it all: the unfathomable rubble, the homeless and the hungry, the German soldiers marched off to
prison camps. And then: the beginnings of recovery and return of the human spirit. Even if you think you’ve
seen it all before on the European war, Berlin 1945 is likely to surprise you."  —Greg Mitchell, blogger, The
Nation

"These photos depict a grotesque normalcy, beyond the well known iconography of heroic liberations and
optimistic rebuilding."  —Der Spiegel Online

"At times eerie and at times prosaic, the photographs, many taken by victorious Soviet Red Army soldiers,
show ordinary people doing extraordinary things in order to rebuild their lives, literally and figuratively,
amid the ruins of a defeated city."  —Jason Walsh, correspondent, Christian Science Monitor

"These never-seen pictures of Berlin in ruins are so forceful, because for those Berliners, destruction was an
everyday experience. This view of history does not leave anybody untouched. untouched." 
—Literaturmarktinfo.de

"A veritable gold mine of historical and, above all, photographical treasures, with something for everyone in
this book, and everything in it, from death to birth, from joy to sadness, from optimism to resignation."
—Luke McCallin, author, The Man from Berlin

From the Author
About Otto Donath           
Otto Donath was born in Berlin in 1898. During World War II, he worked as a photographer for the
propaganda company of the Wehrmacht company 689. After 1945, he took pictures first for the Soviet army,
later for a number of newspapers and magazines in East Berlin, among them Neue Berliner Illustriete and
Für Dich. He died in 1971, in Berlin.
 
About Peter Kroh
Peter Kroh, born in 1950, has worked as a photo reporter for a number of East German newspapers, among



them Junge Welt in Berlin, and Thüringer Allgemeine. In 1995, after the Berlin Wall had come down,  he
moved to the German capital to work for Berliner Kurier. Kroh became the photo editor of the paper. Today,
he is retired. He lives in a small town near Berlin. 

From the Back Cover
Berlin, in May 1945: World War II is over in Europe. The Soviet army has conquered Berlin, a city reduced
to rubble, and now under martial law. Soldiers from America, Great Britain, and France will move in a few
months later. Broken tanks and makeshift barricades are littering the streets, tenements and churches were
turned into bombed-out shells, tunnels have been flooded and train tracks destroyed. German soldiers are
been hauled off to POW-camps in Siberia, while old men are cutting up dead horses for food, women are
trading clothing for survival, and children are left to their own devices in the ruins. And the victors, Russian
soldiers of the Red Army, look as much exhausted as the defeated. These rare pictures have been taken by
photographers of the Red Army and by Germans in their employ immediately after the surrender. They are
published for the first time in the United States, allowing a glimpse into an era of destruction and
desperation, but also survival and rebuilding.
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When you are rushed of work deadline as well as have no suggestion to obtain motivation, Berlin 1945:
World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin book is among your options to take. Book
Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin will certainly provide you the best
source and also thing to get inspirations. It is not just concerning the tasks for politic business,
administration, economics, as well as other. Some ordered works making some fiction works additionally
need motivations to get over the work. As just what you require, this Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of
The Aftermath By Michael Brettin will most likely be your selection.

If you obtain the printed book Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin in
online book shop, you could additionally discover the same issue. So, you should move establishment to
store Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin and also hunt for the readily
available there. But, it will not occur right here. The book Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The
Aftermath By Michael Brettin that we will supply right here is the soft file idea. This is just what make you
can conveniently find as well as get this Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael
Brettin by reading this website. We provide you Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By
Michael Brettin the best item, always and constantly.

Never doubt with our deal, considering that we will always provide just what you require. As such as this
upgraded book Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin, you might not find
in the various other area. But here, it's very easy. Simply click and download, you could have the Berlin
1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin When convenience will reduce your life,
why should take the difficult one? You can purchase the soft file of guide Berlin 1945: World War II: Photos
Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin right here as well as be member people. Besides this book Berlin
1945: World War II: Photos Of The Aftermath By Michael Brettin, you could additionally locate hundreds
listings of the books from several resources, collections, publishers, as well as authors in worldwide.
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These rare pictures from post-war Berlin have been taken by photographers of the Soviet Army and by
Germans in their employ immediately after the surrender and in the months to follow. A city reduced to
rubble, and now under martial law, is imposed by the victorious Communists. And now, broken tanks and
makeshift barricades are littering the streets, tenements and churches are turned into bombed-out shells,
tunnels are flooded and train tracks destroyed. German soldiers have been hauled off to POW-camps in
Siberia, while old men are cutting up dead horses for food, women are trading clothing for survival, and
children are left to their own devices in the ruins. Published for the first time in the United States, this
collection allows a glimpse into an era of destruction and desperation, but also of survival and rebuilding. 
The preface was written by Stephen Kinzer, the former bureau chief of The New York Times in Berlin.
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Review
"We see it all: the unfathomable rubble, the homeless and the hungry, the German soldiers marched off to
prison camps. And then: the beginnings of recovery and return of the human spirit. Even if you think you’ve
seen it all before on the European war, Berlin 1945 is likely to surprise you."  —Greg Mitchell, blogger, The
Nation

"These photos depict a grotesque normalcy, beyond the well known iconography of heroic liberations and
optimistic rebuilding."  —Der Spiegel Online

"At times eerie and at times prosaic, the photographs, many taken by victorious Soviet Red Army soldiers,
show ordinary people doing extraordinary things in order to rebuild their lives, literally and figuratively,
amid the ruins of a defeated city."  —Jason Walsh, correspondent, Christian Science Monitor

"These never-seen pictures of Berlin in ruins are so forceful, because for those Berliners, destruction was an
everyday experience. This view of history does not leave anybody untouched. untouched." 
—Literaturmarktinfo.de

"A veritable gold mine of historical and, above all, photographical treasures, with something for everyone in
this book, and everything in it, from death to birth, from joy to sadness, from optimism to resignation."
—Luke McCallin, author, The Man from Berlin

From the Author



About Otto Donath           
Otto Donath was born in Berlin in 1898. During World War II, he worked as a photographer for the
propaganda company of the Wehrmacht company 689. After 1945, he took pictures first for the Soviet army,
later for a number of newspapers and magazines in East Berlin, among them Neue Berliner Illustriete and
Für Dich. He died in 1971, in Berlin.
 
About Peter Kroh
Peter Kroh, born in 1950, has worked as a photo reporter for a number of East German newspapers, among
them Junge Welt in Berlin, and Thüringer Allgemeine. In 1995, after the Berlin Wall had come down,  he
moved to the German capital to work for Berliner Kurier. Kroh became the photo editor of the paper. Today,
he is retired. He lives in a small town near Berlin. 

From the Back Cover
Berlin, in May 1945: World War II is over in Europe. The Soviet army has conquered Berlin, a city reduced
to rubble, and now under martial law. Soldiers from America, Great Britain, and France will move in a few
months later. Broken tanks and makeshift barricades are littering the streets, tenements and churches were
turned into bombed-out shells, tunnels have been flooded and train tracks destroyed. German soldiers are
been hauled off to POW-camps in Siberia, while old men are cutting up dead horses for food, women are
trading clothing for survival, and children are left to their own devices in the ruins. And the victors, Russian
soldiers of the Red Army, look as much exhausted as the defeated. These rare pictures have been taken by
photographers of the Red Army and by Germans in their employ immediately after the surrender. They are
published for the first time in the United States, allowing a glimpse into an era of destruction and
desperation, but also survival and rebuilding.

Most helpful customer reviews

3 of 3 people found the following review helpful.
Poor Quality-Waste of Money
By Bill McFarlane
The book arrived in the mail today and I have gone over it with a fine tooth comb. I am VERY
DISAPPOINTED. First of all the quality of the photo's in the paperback book are TERRIBLE. There is
nothing in this book you can not see a better and clearer picture of on-line. I urge you to save your money
and avoid this book like the plaque. Ordering this was a complete waste of money. Like I say you can see the
same pictures on line. Cheers Sincerely Bill McFarlane

2 of 3 people found the following review helpful.
Lost (and now found) images of battered Berlin
By Kurt Klein
It's astonishing that those photos never surfaced until now, and have only been found a few years ago in a
hidden drawer in Berlin. This is a book that shows you a part of history you have never seen before. For
instance, I was not really aware that all of Berlin was occupied by only the Russians for quite some time. The
U.S. Army only came later. The sheer level of destruction of the city put 9/11 into perspective. There's also a
lot of information about the last few battles of World War II, and the inner workings of how the Allies came
to their decisions. Another part of the history that we don't hearâ€”or seeâ€” much about is the huge masses
of refugees, not only in 1945, but for years to afterwards. A must-read for every history buff!

1 of 2 people found the following review helpful.
Ten chapters of large black and white photographs. Each ...
By Kai Bolay
Ten chapters of large black and white photographs. Each with a one page introduction setting the scene and



giving context. Each picture has a one sentence caption explaining on obvious details (e.g. location) or
context (relevant statistics, etc.)

The pictures are impressive. The show the devastation of war. They show the victorious Red Army. They
show defeated German soldiers. And they show civilians trying to survive.

If you're interested in the history of the Second World War - especially the battle for Berlin - you should
check out this book.

See all 7 customer reviews...
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